
2/14/2020 Mail - William Watt - Outlook

https://outlook.office.com/mail/deeplink?version=2020021005.10&popoutv2=1 1/3

Re: W-2 and PTO Verification

William Watt <William.Watt@theservicecompanies.com>
Thu 2/13/2020 1:42 PM
To:  cesar taamayo <skato2383@gmail.com>

Hello Cesar, 

Just a follow-up, you will be getting your payout next Friday via direct deposit. Please let me
know if you have any other questions or need anything else! 

Best,

William J Watt 
Assistant Operations Manager

The Service Companies
665 3rd St - Suite 415 | San Francisco, CA 94107

O: 415.670.9901   M: 510.295.8186
E: william.watt@theservicecompanies.com

If you are placing a last-minute order or calling off a
shift, please call our 24-hour answering service at (800) 236-
2276 ext. 2207

From: William Wa� <William.Wa�@theservicecompanies.com>
Sent: Thursday, February 13, 2020 11:44 AM
To: cesar taamayo <skato2383@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: W-2 and PTO Verifica�on
 
Hello Cesar, 

We are looking into this further. We have reached out to the accounting as we see that you
should be receiving the last check. This will be a live check possibly and once they respond
with the direction I will update you. 

Best,

William J Watt 
Assistant Operations Manager

The Service Companies

https://www.theservicecompanies.com/
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William Watt has shared a OneDrive for Business file with you. To view it, click the link below.

Cortez.pdf

665 3rd St - Suite 415 | San Francisco, CA 94107

O: 415.670.9901   M: 510.295.8186
E: william.watt@theservicecompanies.com

If you are placing a last-minute order or calling off a
shift, please call our 24-hour answering service at (800) 236-
2276 ext. 2207

From: cesar taamayo <skato2383@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, February 12, 2020 2:39 PM
To: William Wa� <William.Wa�@theservicecompanies.com>
Subject: Re: W-2 and PTO Verifica�on
 
Check with Angelina about what happened with my payment on Monday, October 14 and my pto
please and thank you

El mié., 12 de febrero de 2020 2:22 p. m., William Watt <William.Watt@theservicecompanies.com>
escribió:

Hello Cesar, 

Please see attached W-2 and the verification of the PTO payout you asked about earlier
today. Your remaining PTO was paid out already and was reflected in the last check that
you have received. 

Please let us know if you have any questions. 

Best,

William J Watt 
Assistant Operations Manager

The Service Companies
665 3rd St - Suite 415 | San Francisco, CA 94107

O: 415.670.9901   M: 510.295.8186
E: william.watt@theservicecompanies.com

If you are placing a last-minute order or calling off a
shift, please call our 24-hour answering service at (800) 236-

https://theservicecompanies0-my.sharepoint.com/:b:/g/personal/angelina_zervas_theservicecompanies_com/EfE3OwTjiK9Glls-rZIa1ZQBiIGIkNS7JQzWAIklK8TlMA
https://theservicecompanies0-my.sharepoint.com/:b:/g/personal/angelina_zervas_theservicecompanies_com/EfE3OwTjiK9Glls-rZIa1ZQBiIGIkNS7JQzWAIklK8TlMA
https://www.theservicecompanies.com/
mailto:William.Watt@theservicecompanies.com
https://theservicecompanies0-my.sharepoint.com/:b:/g/personal/angelina_zervas_theservicecompanies_com/EfE3OwTjiK9Glls-rZIa1ZQBiIGIkNS7JQzWAIklK8TlMA
http://theservicecompanies.com/
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2276 ext. 2207

https://www.theservicecompanies.com/

